Florida Virtual
SCHOOL

Notice of Intended Action
Solicitation Name: Internet Service Provider(s)
Solicitation Number: 1TB01-2403924B01-INTSVC-XXXXXX

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: February 22, 2024 @ 2:00 PM

# Bidder(s)
AT&T CORP.

2 Cogent Communications, Inc.*

3 Spectrum Enterprise**

Note: Florida Virtual School hereby notifies you that it intends to approve the selection of the lowest
priced firm, AT&T CORP. unless otherwise notified; the firm listed will be submitted for approval at
the Board of Trustee’s meeting scheduled on March 12, 2024. Updates to the Board schedule can
be viewed at https://go.boarddocs.com/fla/flvs/Board.nsf/Public.

If you have any questions or concerns regarding the proposal procedures, or our intentions to
accept the aforesaid bid, please contact Joanne Serra at jserra@flvs.net. “Failure to file a protest
within the time prescribed in section 120.57 (3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other
security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.”

We appreciate your interest in doing business with Florida Virtual School and look forward to
receiving your proposals on future endeavors.

Thank you.

* Cogent Communications, Inc. did not include the requirements table or any response to the scope
of work. For this reason, Cogent Communications, Inc. has been eliminated.
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** Spectrum Enterprise answered “No” on multiple requirements within the requirements table. For
this reason, Spectrum Enterprise has been eliminated.

Digitally signed by Adam
H H Vierbickas
Adam VIerbICkas Date: 2024.02.23 09:35:22

BUYER: 0500
Karen Marie Digitally signed by Karen Marie
Stolarenko
WITNESS: Stolarenko Date: 2024.02.23 09:37:50 -0500"

FLVS acknowledges receipt of bids received as recorded above.

Bid Price Sheet Attached Below

Page Intentionally Left Blank

Web: Phone: Email: Procurement Services

www.flvs.net | (407)409-8455 procurement@flvs.net 5422 Carrier Drive, Suite 201 -
Orlando, FL 32819




Florida Virtual
SCHOOL

Cogent Spectrum
L Communications, Inc. Enterprise
£924,047.04 4654,905.00 5486 240.00
Items Facility
# Name TotalCost TotalCost TotalCost
Pensacola Naval Air Station, Escambia Boys Base
Building 3780, Pensacola, FL
#1-1 32511 5218,496.64 Mo Bid Mo Bid
44449 Straightline Road, Crestview Youth
#1-2  Crestview, FL 32539 Academy 525,011.36 Mo Bid Mo Bid
4455 Straightline Road, Okaloosa Youth &
Crestview, FL 325353 Sexual Offender
#1-3 Programs 533,667.20 MNo Bid No Bid
286 Gene Hurley Road, Walton Academy for
#1-4 DeFuniak Springs, FL 32433 Growth and Change  525,011.36 Mo Bid 4 68,4480
5270 Ezell Road, Graceville, FL DOVE Academy
#1-5 32440 523,438.40 533,456.0 Mo Bid
11180 M.E. 3Bth 5treet, Jasper, Dak Grove Academy
#1-6 FL32052 527.473.28 533,095.0 No Bid
950 5W Greenville Hills Road, JoAnn Bridges
Greenville, FL 32331 Academy
#1-7 £23,914.08 MNo Bid No Bid
29841 Liberty Wilderness Juvenile Unit for
Camp Reoad, Sumatra, FL Specialized Treatment
32335 [JUST) and Twin Oaks
Academy (TOVA) 1|
#1-B MNo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
145592 County Road 159, Redwood Youth
#1-8%  Raiford, FL 32083 Academy 524,870.48 No Bid No Bid
4501 Lannie Road, Jacksonville Youth
#1-10 Jacksonville, FL 32218 Academy 523,208.00 531,008.0 No Bid
7500 Ricker Road, Jacksonville, Duval Academy
#1-11 FL32244 £23,208.00 5 60,3840 Mo Bid
4500 Avenue D, 5t. Augustine, 5t. Augustine Youth
#1-12 FL 32085 Academy 528,428.00 5 36,984.0 Mo Bid
1386 Indian Lake Rd, Daytona Daytona Juvenile
#1-13 Beach, FL 32124 Residential Facility ~ $23,208.00 $19,344.0 520,400.0
765 East 5t. Johns Avenue, 5t. Deep Creek Youth
#1-14  Johns, FL 32145 Academy 532,067.36 %55,728.0 No Bid
3430 ME 35th Avenue, Alachua Academy
#1-15 Gainesville, FL 32609 $23,750.40 530,144.0 No Bid
2855 W. Woodland Ridge Cypress Creek
#1-16 Drive, Lecanto, FL 34461 Treatment Center 5$33,667.20 Mo Bid %35,976.0
4055 Morthwest 105th S5treet, Center for Success and
Ocala, FL 34482 Independence - Ocala
#1-17 525,560.96 MNo Bid No Bid
10420 NW Gainesville Road,  Marion Youth
#1-18 Ocala, FL 34482 Academy 525,560.96 Mo Bid No Bid
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3150 39th 5treet, Odando, FL  Orlande Intensive and

32839 Orange Youth

#1-19 Academies 523,438.40 536,384.0 $23,976.0
2145 Bob Phillips Road, Polk Halfway House

#1-20 Bartow, FL 33830 $32,070.48 $23,832.0 No Bid
2330 Mew Beginnings Road, Kissimmee Youth

#1-21 Kissimmee, FL 34744 Academy 533,667.20 5 49,008.0 %35,976.0
4626 Saffold Read, Wimauma, Wimauma Academy

#1-22 FL 33558 543,270.32 Mo Bid 5 86,304.0

3930 W. Martin Luther King Les Peters Academy
Blvd., Tampa, FL 33614

#1-23 $32,070.48 5233230 $ 20,400.0
9502 Columbus Drive, Tampa, Columbus Youth

#1-24 FL 33619 Academy 538,611.20 534,968.0 537,104.0
S506 Columbus Drive, Tampa, Hillsborough Girls

#1-25 FL 33519 Academy 538,705.28 528,272.0 547490
9504 E. Columbus Drive, Lake Academy

#1-26 Tampa, FL 33619 $38,611.20 Mo Bid 5473520
S508 E. Columbus Drive, Tampa Residential

#1-27 Tampa, FL 33619 Facility 538,705.28 $26,568.0 542,408.0
3001 26th Avenue, 5t. Charles Britt Academy

#1-28 Petersburg, FL 33712 Mo Bid 531,704.0 5 20,400.0
9680 Fairgrounds Road, Palm  Palm Beach Youth

#1-29 Beach, FL 33411 Academy 5$23,208.00 Mo Bid No Bid
2515 Ortiz Avenue, Ft. Myers, Fort Myers Academy
FL 33305

#1-30 528,005.60 Mo Bid No Bid
5050 NE 1638th Street, Everglades Youth

#1-31 Okeechobee, FL 34972 Academy $33,667.20 Mo Bid Mo Bid
8301 Sowth Palm Drive, Broward Youth
Building 2, Pembroke Pines, FL Treatment Center

#1-32 33025 523,438.40 533,456.0 Mo Bid
3300 N'W 27th Avenue, 35th  South Florida Youth
Street Entrance, Miami, FL Academy

#1-33 33142 %$16,828.32 531,008.0 No Bid
10855 5W B4th Street, Miami, Miami Youth Academy

#1-34 FL 33173 $23,208.00 531,008.0 Mo Bid

2 One-time Implementation Fee (Per Site) [34)

Pensacola Maval Air Station, Escambia Boys Base
Building 3780, Pensacola, FL

#2-1 37511 50 Mo Bid No Bid
4449 Straightline Road, Crestwiew Youth
#2-2 Crestview, FL 32539 Academy $600.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid
4455 Straightline Road, Okaloosa Youth &
Crestview, FL 32539 Sexual Offender
#2-3 Programs S600.00 Mo Bid No Bid
286 Gene Hurley Road, Walton Academy for
#2-4  DeFuniak Springs, FL 32433 Growth and Change  $600.00 Mo Bid 50
5270 Ezell Road, Graceville, FL DOVE Academy
#2-5 37440 50 Mo Bid No Bid
11180 M.E. 38th Street, Jasper, Oak Grove Academy
#2-6  FL 32052 S0 Mo Bid Mo Bid
S50 3W Greenville Hills Road, Jofnn Bridges
#2-7  Greenville. FL 32331 Academy 5600.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid
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29841 Liberty Wilderness Juvenile Unit for
Camp Road, Sumatra, FL Specialized Treatment
32335 [JUST) and Twin Oaks
Academy (TOVA) II

#1-B Mo Bid MNo Bid No Bid
14692 County Road 199, Redwood Youth

#1-8  Raiford, FL 32083 Academy S0 Mo Bid No Bid
4501 Lannie Road, Jacksonville Youth

fL-10 Jacksonville, FL 32218 Academy S0 Mo Bid No Bid
7500 Ricker Road, lacksenville, Duval Academy

#2-11 FL 32244 S0 Mo Bid No Bid
4500 Avenue D, 5t. Augustine, 5t Augustine Youth

#2-12 FL 32085 Academy 50 No Bid No Bid
1386 Indian Lake Rd, Daytona [Daytona Juvenile

#2-13 Beach, FL 32124 Residential Facility 50 5575 50
765 East 5t. Johns Avenue, 5t.  Deep Creek Youth

#2-14 Johns, FL 32145 Academy 50 Mo Bid No Bid
3430 ME 35th Avenue, Alachua Academy

#2-15  Gainesville, FL 32609 50 Mo Bid No Bid
2855 W. Woodland Ridge Cypress Creek

#2-16  Drive, Lecanto, FL 34461 Treatment Center 5600.00 Mo Bid 50
4055 Morthwest 105th 5treet, Center for Success and
Ocala, FL 34482 Independence - Ocala

#2-17 S600.00 Mo Bid No Bid
10420 NW Gainesville Road, Maricn Youth

#2-18 Ocala, FL 34482 Academy S600.00 Mo Bid No Bid
3150 39th Street, Odando, FL  Orlande Intensive and
32835 Orange Youth

#2-19 Academies 50 Mo Bid 50
2145 Bob Phillips Road, Polk Halfway House

#2-20 Bartow, FL 33830 50 5575 No Bid
2330 Mew Beginnings Road, Kissimmee Youth

#2-21 Kissimmee, FL 34744 Academy S600.00 5575 50
4626 Saffold Road, Wimauma, Wimauma Academy

#2-22 FL335%3 50 Mo Bid s0
3930 W. Martin Luther King Les Peters Academy
Blvd., Tampa, FL 33614

#2-23 S0 Mo Bid 50
8502 Columbus Drive, Tampa, Columbus Youth

#2-24 FL33619 Academy S0 5575 50
S506 Columbus Drive, Tampa, Hillsborough Girls

#2-25 FL33619 Academy 50 5575 50
5504 E. Columbus Drive, Lake Academy

#2-26 Tampa, FL 33619 50 Mo Bid 50
S508 E. Columbus Drive, Tampa Residential

#2-27 Tampa, FL 33619 Facility S0 5575 s0
3001 26th Avenue, 5t. Charles Britt Academy

#2-28 Petersburg, FL 33712 Mo Bid 5575 50
5680 Fairgrounds Road, Palm  Palm Beach Youth

#2-29 Beach, FL 33411 Academy 50 No Bid No Bid
2515 Ortiz Avenue, Ft. Myers, Fort Myers Academy

#2-30 FL 33905 $600.00 Mo Bid No Bid
5050 ME 168th Street, Everglades Youth

#2-31 Okeechobee, FL 34972 Academy $600.00 Mo Bid No Bid
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8301 South Palm Drive, Broward Youth
Building 2, Pembroke Pines, FL Treatment Center
#2-32 33005 50 Mo Bid No Bid
3300 NW 27th Avenue, 35th  South Florida Youth
Street Entrance, Miami, FL Academny
#2-33 33147 50 Mo Bid Mo Bid
10855 5W B4th Street, Miami, Miami Youth Academy
#2-34 FL33173 50 Mo Bid No Bid
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